AGGREGATES 2011

Brox Industries Inc.

1471 Methuen Street
Dracut, MA 01826

PJ Keating Co.

998 Reservoir Rd.
Lunenburg, MA 01462

Stone - 2 inch
Pick up @ Plant NO BID $10.75/TON
Delivered Per Ton NO BID $14.25/TON
Stone - 1 1/2 Inch
Pick up @ Plant $9.00/TON $10.50/TON
Delivered Per Ton $12.00/TON $14.00/TON
Stone - 3/4 Inch
Pick up @ Plant $9.00/TON $10.50/TON
Delivered Per Ton $12.00/TON $14.00/TON
Erosion Stone 6 inch
Pick up @ Plant $11.00/TON $12.25/TON
Delivered Per Ton $14.00/TON $15.75/TON
Stone Dust
Pick up @ Plant $12.00/TON $9.00/TON
Delivered Per Ton $16.00/TON $12.00/TON
Bank Run Gravel
Per Cubic Yard or Ton NO BID NO BID
Delivered Per Yard or Ton NO BID NO BID
Clean Fill
Per Ton $3.75/TON $4.25/TON
Delivered Per Ton $6.75/TON $7.75/TON
1 1/2 inch Crushed Gravel
Per Ton $6.75/TON $11.25/TON
Delivered Per Ton $9.75/TON $14.75/TON
3/4 inch Crushed Gravel
Per Ton $6.75/TON $9.50/TON
Delivered Per Ton $9.75/TON $13.00/TON
3/4 inch Crushed
Rapbase (asphalt)
Per Ton $7.00/TON $9.00/TON
Delivered Per Ton $10.00/TON $12.50/TON
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SAND-2011

Brox Industries Inc.

1472 Methuen Street
Dracut, MA 01826

Sand (Delivered)

per Cubic Yard |$11.00/TON
Sand - Pick up at

Plant (or Ton) |$8.00/TON
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High Density Polyethylene Culvert Pipe
Diameter & Priced per Linear Foot Delivered

2011

Ferguson Water

JAF Industries,

Vellano Bros.,

Eliminator

Works Inc. Inc.” Systems, Inc.
19 Courtland St.  |309 State Route
1 Chester Rd. Londonderry, NH (27, Raymond  [PO Box 860
Raymond NH 03077 |03053 NH 0307727 |Durham NH 03824
8" Pipe
Solid Pipe $3.12 $3.12 $3.52 $3.00
Perforated Pipe $3.12 $3.12 $3.52 $3.00
Per Collar Delivered $4.02 $3.90 $3.52 $7.00
10" Pipe
Solid Pipe $4.43 $4.43 $4.74 $4.00
Perforated Pipe $4.43 $4.43 $4.74 $4.00
Per Collar Delivered $5.33 $5.36 $4.74 $6.20
12" Pipe
Solid Pipe $5.01 $5.01 $5.32 $5.00
Perforated Pipe $5.01 $5.01 $5.32 $5.00
Per Collar Delivered $6.25 $6.05 $7.50 $10.00
15" Pipe
Solid Pipe $6.44 $6.44 $6.55 $6.00
Perforated Pipe $6.44 $6.44 $6.55 $6.00
Per Collar Delivered $10.41 $10.07 $9.50 $11.50
18" Pipe
Solid Pipe $10.01 $10.01 $9.30 $8.75
Perforated Pipe $10.01 $10.01 $9.30 $8.75
Per Collar Delivered $17.73 $17.16 $15.00 $15.00
24" Pipe
Solid Pipe $15.03 $15.03 $13.69 $15.00
Perforated Pipe $15.03 $15.03 $13.69 $15.00
Per Collar Delivered $25.01 $24.20 $26.00 $17.50
30" Pipe
Solid Pipe $23.51 $23:51 $21.75 $25.00
Perforated Pipe $23.51 $23.51 $21.75 $25.00
Per Collar Delivered $58.78 $56.27 $60.00 No Bid
36" Pipe
Solid Pipe $27.20 $27.20 $28.22 $32.50
Perforated Pipe $27.20 $27.20 $28.22 $32.50
Per Collar Delivered $77.43 $78.29 $90.00 $97.00
42" Pipe
Solid Pipe $35.00 $35.00 $40.14 $42.00
Perforated Pipe $35.00 $35.00 $40.14 $42.00
Per Collar Delivered $111.48 $114.60 $142.00 NoBid ..
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Plow Blades 2011
Jordan
Equipment Atlantic Valk
Plow Blades & Bolts Co. Broom Manufacturing
744 Clough
Mill Rd 4 Robinson |PO Box 428
Pembroke, Rd Bow, NH |New Kingstown,
NH 03275 03301 PA 17072
Size Plow B lade Bolt Spacing
132"x 6"x 5/8" SHP[12" on center $113.74 $109.83 $105.00
120" x 6" x 5/8" SHP|{12" on center $103.40 $99.84 $95.00
108" x 6" x 5/8" SHP[12" on center $93.06 $89.86 $86.00
96" x 6" x 5/8" SHP|12" on center $82.72 $79.88 $67.00
12" on center
Carbide blades 3/4" x|price per foot
6"|delivered $44.00 $45.00 $45.74
Bolts with Nuts and Price/100
Lock Washers Delivered
2" x 5/8 carriage bolts $90.00 $1.00 $0.75
2 & 1/2" x 5/8" carriage
bolts $96.00 $1.15 $0.90
3 & 1/2" x 5/8" carriage
bolts $114.00 $1.25 $1.50
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East Coast Corriveau-
Calcium Chloride AH Harris Lumber Routhier
159 Temple
255 West Rd East Hampstead, |Street Nashua,
2011|Portsmouth NH NH 03826 NH 03060
Calcium Chloride per
ton sold in 50lb. Bags
Delivered $540/Ton ($13.50/bag $630/Ton $14.49/Bag
PickUp $540/Ton 56 bags/pallet) $610/Ton
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Hottop & Cold Patch

PJ Keating Co

2011

Y8 Reservorr
Road
Lunenburg, MA
01462

Brox Industries
Inc.

1471 Methuen St.
Dracut, MA
01826

Per Ton Picked up

Per Ton Picked

Hottop @ Plant up @ Plant*
3/8" Top $61.00 $67.00
1/2" Top $61.00 $69.00
3/4" Binder $59.00 $67.00
Cold Patch $85.00 $87.00
Patch $100.00 $109.00

* Add $30/ton for Hot top picked up
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Catchbasin Blocks, Corriveau-Routhier, |Hudson Quarry |East Coast
Concrete Blocks & Bricks [inc. Corp* Lumber
4 Colonial
6 Candy Ln., Drive, East
169 Temple St. Hudson, NH Hampstead
2011Nashua, NH 03060 [03051 NH 03826
Catchbasin Blocks, Priced
Concrete Blocks & Bricks Price Delivered Price Delivered [Delivered
Barrel Block (each) 8" wall $2.99 $2.46 $2.50
#1 Batter Block (each) 8"
wall $4.89 n/a -
#2 Batter Block (each) 8"
wall $4.89 n/a -
# 3 Batter Block (each) 8"
wall $4.89 n/a -
# 4 Batter Block (each) 8"
wall $4.89 n/a -
4" x 8" x 16" Solid Blocks
(pallet) $1.99 $1.34 $1.30
2" x 8" x 4" Sewer Bricks
(Pallet) $0.59 $0.50 -
2" x 8" x 2" Solid Blocks
(Pallet) $0.98 $1.35 -
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Hi-Way Safety

Signs & Related Items |Systems Inc. Atlantic Broom [Rocal, Inc
9 Rockview Way 3186 CR 550,
Rockland, MA 4 Robinson Rd. |Frankfort, OH
2011]02370 Bow, NH 03321 (45628

Per Item/Per Dozen

Item

Per ltem/Per
Dozen

Per ltem/Per
Dozen

* Note- (Delivery is 30 days
ARO)

30" x 30" stop sign
reflective Sheeting on
.080 aluminum

$35.00/$420.00

$34.25/$411.00

$29.43/$353.16

30" x 30" right or left
curve sign reflective
sheeting on .080
aluminum

$35.00/$420.00

$34.25/$411.00

$29.43/$353.16

24" x 18" childre sign
reflective sheeting on
.080 aluminum

$16.80/$201.60

$16.50/$198.00

$14.13/$169.56

24" x 18" chevron sign
reflective sheeting on
.080 aluminum

$16.80/$201.60

$16.50/$198.00

$14.13/$169.56

24" x 18" 15, 20, 25, 30,
or 35mph speed limit
sign on reflective
sheeting aluminum

$16.80/$201.60

$16.50/$198.00

$14.13/$169.56

24" x 18" no parking
sign on .080 aluminum

$16.80/$201.60

$16.50/$198.00

$14.13/$169.56

Blind Driveway Sign 24"
x 18" reflective sheeting
on .080 aluminum

$16.80/$201.60

$16.50/$198.00

$14.13/$169.56

24 x 24 Dead End Sign
reflective Sheeting on

.080 Alumunum|  $20.00/$240.00 $19.50/$234. $18.84/$226.08
Del. Price 50 or
More

10 Ft green Channel

sign posts 30 3/8: holes
on 1" center $16.50 $16.25/each No Bid

6 ft green channel sign

posts 3/8: holes on 1"
centers $7.50 $6.99/Each No Bid
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Signs & Related Items

2011

Hi-Way Safety
Systems Inc.

9 Rockview Way
Rockland, MA
02370

Atlantic Broom

4 Robinson Rd.
Bow, NH 03321

Rocal, Inc

3186 CR 550,
Frankfort, OH
45628

Per Iltem/Per
Dozen

9" wide street signs,
extended .091
thickness with green
reflectorized copy with
white 6" uppercase
letters for street names
and 3" uppercase
letters for stree
abbreviations

$32.00/$384.00

$32.00/$384.00

$27.50/$330

U Channel post bracket
for 9" extruded plates

Wing bracket
(cantilever) for 9"
extruded plates

$14.50/$174.00

$7.50/$90.00

$14.30/$171.60

$6.12/$73.44

Plastic barricades 26" x
36" with reflective rail
fences

$57.00

$57.20
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Painting Traffic Lines

Hi-Way Safety
Systems

9 Rockview Way

Seal Tec Asphalt

Coatings, Inc.
3 Sanborn Rd.,
Londonderry, NH

Markings Inc,.
30 Riverside Dr.
Pembroke, MA

2011J|Rockland, MA 02370 |03053 02359
Bid

Double yellow center line
footage per lineal foot $0.062 $0.060 $0.068

Single white edge line
footage per lineal foot $0.031 $0.038 $0.035

Crosswalkfootage per lineal .

foot $0.330 $0.500 $0.380

stop line footage per lineal
foot $0.330 $0.500 $0.380
Parking line footage $0.130 $0.200 $0.160

Blue & White handicap
markings $35.000 $20.000 $42.750
Crosswalk footage $0.140 $0.500 $0.180
Directional Arrows $16.000 $18.000 $16.950
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Roadside Mowing

2011

Rail Head Tractor

124 Purgatory Rd.,
Lyndeboro NH
03082

Bid

Roadside Mowing /Hr.

Roadside Mowing/Mile

$92.56/MILE or

$6,850
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National Water
Catch Basin {Main Cleaning |Leo Vigeant
Cleaning Co.* Co., Inc. Hartigan
409 High Hill
25 Marshall St.  |Rd 31 Welch Park
Canton, MA N. Dartmouth , Dr. Middlesex,
2011402021 MA 02747 Vermont 05602

*Town to provide disposal
. site. - $1.50/LF for lateral
Bid Jetting.

Price per
catch basin $24.00/Basin $9.25/Basin $32.750
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Tree Removal

Rich's Tree Service

2011

PO Box 2336
Salem NH 03079

Bid Specifications

Per/ Hour - $200.000
Per Hour Minimum 4 hr. min.
Equipment
Make Daewoo/National
Model 1295
Year 1995
Operating Wgt 58,000 |bs.
Reach 125'
Digging Depth N/A
Bucket Size N/A
Lifting capacity 28 Tons
Body Size S
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Street Sweeper-Rental
w/ operator

2011

Immaculate Power
Sweeping, LLC

1401 Mammoth Rd.
Pelham, NH 03076

Hi-Way Safety
Systems, Inc.

9 Rockview Way,
Rockland, MA

02370

Bid Specifications

Per/ Hour -

$89/Hr.|

Per Hour Minimum

Equipment
Make| Elgin/Freightliner
Broom Bear
Model] Sweeper/Street
Year 2004
Operating Wgt 33,000 Ibs.
Extended High
Reach Dump
Digging Depth N/A
Bucket Size N/A
Lifting capacity N/A
Body Size 4 CY
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Demolition

Hammer Richard D. Vinal
w/Operator Trucking, Inc. Capital Rock
625 Broadway Rd. |164 Bedford Rd New
2011]Dracut, MA 01826 |[Boston, NH 03070
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $187.500 $250.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make Samsung Hitachi
Model] SE 210LC-3 EX 450
Year 1999 2000
Operating Wgt 47,000 Ibs 110,000 Ibs
Reach N/A N/A
Digging Depth N/A 30'
Bucket Size N/A N/A
Lifting capacity N/A N/A
Body Size N/A N/A
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10 Wheel
Dump Trucks
w/ Operator

2011

Richard D. Vinal
Trucking, Inc.

625 Broadway Rd.
Dracut, MA 01826

Immaculate Power
Sweeping, LLC

1401Mammoth Rd.
Pelham, NH 03076

Avalance
Enterprises, LLC
PO Box 4993,
Manchester, NH
03108

Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $65.000 $70.000 $65.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make Mack GMC Western Star
Model RD600 10 Wheel Dump Triaxel Dump
Year 1987 2003 2001
Operating Wgt 28,000 lbs 54,900 73-75K lbs.
Reach N/A N/A N/A
Digging Depth N/A N/A N/A
Bucket Size N/A N/A N/A
Lifting capacity N/A N/A N/A
Body Size 16 yds 16 yds 20 yds.
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Rubber Tire

Richard D. Vinal

Escavator Trucking, Inc.
625 Broadway Rd.
2011|Dracut, MA 01826
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $120.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make Samsung
Model SE 210-W-2
Year 1997
Operating Wagt 44,000 lbs
Reach 32 feet
Digging Depth
3/4 trench
Bucket Size w/knuckle
Lifting capacity N/A
Body Size N/A
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Front End
Loader- with

Richard D. Vinal

Operator Trucking, Inc. Avalanche
PO Box 4993
625 Broadway Rd. |Manchester, NH
2011|Dracut, MA 01826 {03108
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $100.000 $97.500
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make 950H CAT Komatsu
Model 950H WA320-LC6
Year 2006 2000
Operating Wgt 42,435 |bs 32,000 Ibs.
Reach N/A 14'
Digging Depth N/A N/A
Bucket Size 4 1/2 yds 4 yards
Lifting capacity 5,000 lbs+
Body Size N/A N/A
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Bulldozer w/ Richard D. Vinal |Avalance,
Operator Trucking, Inc. Enterprises, LLC
PO Box 4993,
625 Broadway Rd. [Manchester, NH
2011}Dracut, MA 01826 {03108
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $80.000 $78.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make Dresser Cat
Model TD8G D4C
Year 1988 1999
Operating Wgt 17,150 Ibs 18,000 Ibs.
Reach N/A N/A
Digging Depth N/A N/A
Bucket Size N/A N/A
Lifting capacity N/A N/A
Body Size N/A N/A
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Excavator with

Demolition Richard D. Vinal
Hammer Trucking, Inc. Capital Rock
306 River Rd.
625 Broadway Rd. [New Boston, NH
2011 Dracut, MA 01826 (03070
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $187.500 $250.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make SAMSUNG Hitachi
Modell SE 210LC-3 EX450
Year 1999 2000
Operating Wat 47,000 Ibs 110,000 Ibs
Reach N/A N/A
Digging Depth N/A N/A
Bucket Size N/A N/A
With Kent KF-22 | 10,000 kbs wutg Atlas
Lifting capacity|demolition hammer Copco

Body Size
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Grader w/

Richard D. Vinal

Operator Trucking, Inc.
625 Broadway Rd.
2011 Dracut, MA 01826
Bid
Specifications
Per/ Hour - $110.000
Per Hour
Minimum
Equipment
Make| Austin Western
Model Super 100
Year 1969
Operating Wgt 22,000 Ibs
Reach N/A
Digging Depth N/A
Bucket Size N/A
Lifting capacity N/A

Body Size

(Grader blade 11"
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