BID SHEET AND SPECIFICATIONS
AGGREGATES

The Town of Pelham, NH is seeking competitive bids for the supply of aggregates to be
used by the Highway Department for roadway construction from January 1, 2022, through
December 31, 2022. All aggregates must meet the latest edition of the state of New Hampshire
specifications. All aggregates will be bought on an as needed basis.

Interested parties must complete this bid sheet and return it to the Selectmen's office by
4:00 p.m. on December 16, 2021. Bids will be opened at the Pelham Highway Department, 33
Newcomb Field Parkway, Pelham, NH on Friday, December 17, 2021, at 10:00 A.M.

*PICK UP AT PLANT DELIVERED
PER TON
Stone 2-to-4-inch | No Bid ' No Bid
1 1/2 inch 1$13.00/Ton | $16.60/Ton
3/4 inch 1$13.00/Ton 1$16.60/Ton
EROSION STONE 3 to 6 inch | $14.50/Ton | $18.10/Ton
STONE DUST . No Bid No Bid
PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
OR TON OR TON
CLEAN FILL | $6.25/Ton | $9.85/Ton
1 1/2-inch CRUSHED GRAVEL [ $8.50/Ton l $12.10/Ton
3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL | $8.50/Ton 1$12.10/Ton
3/4" CRUSHED Rap base (asphalt) | $9.25/Ton 1$12.85/Ton
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*Pick Up at Brox Industries Hudson, NH Plant -85 Greeley Street Hudson, NH 03051



BID SHEET AND SPECIFICATIONS
AGGREGATES

The Town of Pelham, NH is seeking competitive bids for the supply of aggregates to be
used by the Highway Department for roadway construction from January 1, 2022, through ‘
December 31, 2022. Ali aggregates must meet the latest edition of the state of New Hampshire
specifications. All aggregates will be bought on an as needed basis.

Interested parties must compiete this bid sheet and return it to the Selectmen's office by
4:00 p.m. on December 16, 2021. Bids will be opened at the Pelham Highway Department, 33
Newcomb Field Parkway, Pelham, NH on Friday, December 17, 2021, at 10:00 AM.

PICK UP AT PLANT DELYVERED
PER TON
Stone 2-to-4-inch { NoBid | NoBid
1 1/2 inch | $14.75 | $18.85
Fourteen dollars and seventy-five cents  Eighteen dollars and eighty-five cents
3/4 inch f$14.25 | $18.35

Fourteen dollars and twenty-five cents  Eighteen dollars and thirty-five cents

EROSION STONE 3 to 6 inch

| No Bid | No Bid
STONE DUST $8.75. $12.85
| Eight dollars and seventy-five cents | Twelve dollars and eighty-five cents
PER CUBIC YARD PER CUBIC YARD
OR TON OR TON
CLEAN FILL | $4.00on | $8.01/Ton
Four dollars and zero cents Eight dollars and one cent
1 1/2-inch CRUSHED GRAVEL |$16.75/Ton | $20.85/Ton
Sixteen dollars and seventy-five cents — Twenty dollars and eighty-five cents
3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL | $13.50/Ton | $17.60/Ton
Thirteen dollars and fifty cents Seventeen dollars and sixty cents
3/4" CRUSHED Rap base (asphalt) | $8.00/Ton |$12.10/Ton
Eight dollars and zero cents Twelve dollars and ten cents
COMPANY _P-J. Keating Company DATE 12/16/2021

ADDRESS 998 Reservoir Road, Lunenburg, MA 014627 2

AUTHORIZED SIGNATURE D%/ /?/V‘
NAME PRINTED I\cﬂu) @fewct’(
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