
EQUIPMENT
COMPANY RICHARD D. VINAL TRUCKING INC
FRONT END LOADER
MAKE 950 CAT
MODEL 950 H FRONT END LOADER
YEAR 2006
OPERATING WGT 42,435 LBS
REACH N/A
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE 4 YDS
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $100.00
RUBBER TIRED EXCAVATOR W/KNUCKLE ATTCH
MAKE SAMSUG
MODEL SE 210- W 2
YEAR 1997
OPERATING WGT 44,000 LBS
REACH 32'
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE 3/4 YD TRENCH BCKT W/KNUCKLE
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $125.00
ROAD GRADER
MAKE AUSTIN-WESTERN
MODEL SUPER 100 
YEAR 1969
OPERATING WGT 22,000 LBS
REACH N/A
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE N/A
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $125.00
BULLDOZER
MAKE DRESSER
MODEL TD 8 G
YEAR 1988
OPERATING WGT 17,150 LBS
REACH N/A
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE N/A
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $90.00
TEN WHELL DUMP TRUCK
MAKE MACK
MODEL CH-713
YEAR 2000
OPERATING WGT 28,100 LBS
REACH N/A
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE N/A
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE 16 YDS
HOURLY RATE $80.00
EXCAVATOR W/DEMOLITION HAMMER
MAKE SAMSUNG
MODEL SE 210 LC 3 W/ DEMOLITION HAMMER KENT KF-22
YEAR 1999
OPERATING WGT 47,000 LBS
REACH 32'
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE N/A
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $187.50



AGGREGATES                
COMPANY NORTHEAST SAND & GPJ KEATING COM BROX INDUSTRIES, INC
PICK UP AT PLANT STONE
2 INCH NO BID $16.50 TON NO BID
1 1/2 INCH $11.00 TON $15.50 TON $11.50 TON
3/4 INCH $12.00 TON $15.50 TON $11.50 TON
EROSION STONE 6 INCH NO BID $17.25 TON $11.50 TON
STONE DUST NO BID $15.00 TON $17.50 TON
PER CUBIC YARD OR TON PICKED UP
CLEAN FILL $6.00/YARD NO BID $4.50 TON
1 1/2 INCH CRUSHED GRAV $10.00/TON $15.50 TON $7.50 TON
3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL $11.00 TON $14.75 TON $7.50 TON
3/4" CRUSHED RAP BASE (A NO BID $6.50 TON $7.00 TON
DELIVERED PER TON STONE
2 INCH NO BID $20.50 TON NO BID
1 1/2 INCH $18.65 TON $19.50 TON $15.00 TON
3/4 INCH $19.65 TON $19.50 TON $15.00 TON
EROSION STONE 6 INCH NO BID $21.25 TON $15.00 TON
STONE DUST NO BID $19.00 TON $21.00 TON
PER CUBIC YARD OR TON DELIVERED
CLEAN FILL $15.75 YARD NO BID $8.00 TON
1 1/2 INCH CRUSHED GRAV $17.65 TON $19.50 TON $11.00 TON
3/4" CRUSHED GRAVEL $18.65 TON $18.75 TON $11.00 TON
3/4" CRUSHED RAP BASE (A NO BID $10.50 TON $10.50 TON



SAND TON= TN   YARD= YD

COMPANY DELIVERED PICK UP
NORTHEAST SAND & GRAVEL$13.90 TN $6.25 TN
BROX INDUSTRIES, INC $17.50 TN $14.00 TN



HOT TOP COLD PATCH
COMPANY 3/8" TOP 1/2" TOP 3/4" BINDER COLD PATCH HIGH PERFORMANCE COLD PATCH

BROX INDUSTRIES, INC 66 66 66 NO BID $125.00
PJ KEATING COMPANY 64.5 64.5 64.5 NO BID NO BID



BLOCK CONCRETE
COMPANY HUDSON QUARRY
BARREL BLOCK (EA) 8" WALL $2.97
#1 BATTER BLOCK (EA) 8" WALL N/A
#2 BATTER BLOCK (EA) 8" WALL N/A
#3 BATTER BLOCK (EA) 8" WALL N/A
#4 BATTER BLOCK (EA) 8" WALL N/A
4"X 8" X 16" SOLID BLOCKS (EA) $1.62
2" X 8" X 4" SEWER BRICKS (EA) $0.75
6" X 8" X 16" SOLID BLOCKS (EA) $2.54



CALCIUM CHLORIDE PER TON SOLD IN 50LB. BAGS
COMPANY DELIVEREDPICK UP
HD SUPPLY C & I AH HARRIS $620.00 $620.00
PERK PRODUCTS & CHEMICAL CO., I $628.00 $628.00
DART SEASONAL PRODUCTS INC INVALID BI INVALID BID



PLOW BLADES
COMPANY JORDAN EQUIPMATLANTIC BROOM SERV  VALK MANUFACTURING COMPANY
SIZE PLOW BLADE/BOLT SPACING $ PER BLADE DELIVERED
132"X6"X5/8" SHP 12" CNTR $93.72 $109.82 $117.00
120"X6"X5/8" SHP 12" CNTR $85.20 $99.84 $106.00
108"X6"X5/8" SHP 12" CNTR $76.68 $89.86 $96.00
96"X6"X5/8" SHP 12 CNTR $68.16 $79.84 $85.00
CARBIDE BLADES 3/4"X6" 12" CNTR $ PER F  $44.69 $48.00 $50.82 / FOOT
BOLTS WITH NUTS & LOCK WASHERS
2"X5/8 CARRIAGE BOLTS GRADE 8 $75.00 $1.95 $150.00
2 1/2"X 5/8" CARRIAGE BOLTS GRADE 8 $86.00 $2.05 $200.00
3 1/2"X5/8" CARRIAGE BOLTS GRADE 8 $99.00 $2.20 $250.00



SIGNS AND RELATED 
COMPANY ATLANTIC BROOM SERVIC  AMERICAN FLAGGING & TRAFFIC CONTROL, INC
30"X30" STOP SIGN $37.00 $45.50
30"X30" RT/LT CURVE $37.00 $54.50
24"X18" CAUTION CHILD $18.00 $28.25
24"X18" CHEVRON $18.00 $28.25
24"X18" SPEED LIMIT $18.00 $28.25
24"X18" NO PARKING $18.00 $28.25
BLIND DRIVEWAY $18.00 $28.25
24"X24" DEAD END/NO OUTLET $24.00 $39.95
10 FT GRN SIGN POST $22.50 $28.50
6 FT GRN SIGN POST $8.68 $12.70
9" WIDE STREET SUGNS $27.00 $32.90
U POST BRCKT 9" PLATES $17.50 $20.25
WING BRCKT(CANTILEVER) 9" $13.60 $38.75
PLASTIC BARRICADES 26"X36" $88.19 NO BID



HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE CULVERT PIPE
COMPANY JAF INDUSTRIES, INC
SOLID PIPE
8" $3.18
10" $4.52
12" $5.11
15" $6.57
18" $10.21
24" $15.33
30" $24.22
36" $28.02
42" $36.05
PERFORATED PIPE $ PER LINEAR FT DELIVERED
8" $3.18
10" $4.52
12" $5.11
15" $6.57
18" $10.21
24" $15.33
30" $24.22
36" $28.02
42" $36.05
PRICE PER COLLAR DELIVERED
8" $4.34
10" $5.96
12" $6.96
15" $11.23
18" $19.13
24" $26.99
30" $62.74
36" $87.26
42" $127.77



PAINTING LINES FOOTAGE PER LINEAL FOOT
COMPANY DBL YELLOW CNTR SNGL WHT EDGE
HI WAY SAFETY SYSTEMS IN 0.082 0.041
MARKINGS INC $0.09 0.045



CATCH BASIN
COMPANY BELLEMORE TRITON STORM WATERLEO VIGEART CO. IN BRADFORD TREE
PRICE PER CATCH-BASIN $35.00 $25.00 $11.33 $120.00 HRLY

USING A STETCO CATVAC TRUCK A BASIN INVALID BID
BASIN CLEANER



TREE REMOVAL
COMPANY BRADFORD TREE & LAWN CARE LL RICH'S TREE SERVIC RICH'S TREE SERVICE
MAKE INTERNATIONAL GMC FREIGHT LINER
MODEL BUCKET TRUCK C7500 CRANE
YEAR 1998 2000 2001
OPERATING WGT 26000 LBS 34000 LBS 58000 LBS
REACH 65" 55' 95'
DIGGING DEPTH N/A N/A N/A 
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE N/A 2 MAN N/A 
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A N/A 21 TON
BODY SIZE N/A N/A N/A
HOURLY RATE $159.00 $150.00 $200.00 CRANE & CLIMBER 



STREET SWEEPERS
COMPANY IMMACULATE POWER SWEEPING
MAKE ELGIN
MODEL BROOM BADGER
YEAR 2016
OPERATING WGT 19500 LBS
REACH 10'
DIGGING DEPTH N/A
HOPPER/BUCKET SIZE 4 YARD
LIFTING CAPACITY N/A
BODY SIZE N/A
HOURLY RATE $124.00 NO TRAVEL FEE


	EQUIPMENT
	AGGREGATES
	SAND
	HOT TOP COLD PATCH
	BLOCK CONCRETE
	CALCIUM CHLORIDE
	PLOW BLADES
	SIGNS AND RELATED
	CULVERT PIPE
	PAINTING LINES
	CATCH BASIN
	TREE REMOVAL
	STREET SWEEPERS

